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Philippines: 2 Batches of Special 21-Day Hyojeong Leadership Training Program to Raise Frontliners in 
Heavenly Tribal Messiah Providence 
 
As part of the program to nurture aspiring young leaders to become a Heavenly Tribal Messiah 
Coordinators and Junior Tribal Messiahs for the victorious accomplishment of Vision 2020, Philippines, 
as one of the key strategic nations already conducted two batches of Special 21-Day Hyojeong Leadership 
Training Program (HJLTP) held at the International Peace Leadership College in Rizal province, 
Philippines with the first batch taking place on March 4-27, 2019 and the second batch held on April 18 – 
May 9, 2019. 
 

 
 
The two batches of 21-day training were participated in by a total of 150 1st generation and 2nd 
generation participants mostly young members from different regions in the Philippines and some from 
other nations who are part of the Youth Leadership Training (YLT) International. HJ Leadership Training 
Program was first initiated by Heavenly Asia Pacific Region in Pak Chong Training Center in Thailand, 
spearheaded by Dr. Chung Sik Yong, Regional Group Chairman with the goal of training members 
including second generation to become Heavenly Tribal Messiah fulltime coordinators. As the heavenly 
tribal messiah activities are vastly expanding, the need for full time members who can assist in the follow-
up programs in the Heavenly Tribal Messiah areas became more paramount. The participants go through 
intensive training in giving lectures on Divine principle, Blessed Family Traditions, Blessing, True 
Parents' Life Course and HJ Cheonbo Providence including familiarization of Home Group System and 



 

 

pastoring. Best practices related to growth in the Heavenly Tribal Messiah areas were also presented 
during the workshop. These Heavenly Tribal Messiah Coordinators will work side by side with the 
Heavenly Tribal Messiahs as they build strong foundation centering on the different tribes. HJLTP-
Philippines has Rev. Leo Angelo T. Halog, Vice National Leader of FFWPU Philippines as the Director 
of the Program and assisted by some Filipino graduates of the HJLTP conducted in Thailand. 
 

 
 
The training program was greatly supported by having several top leaders and lecturers from International 
and from Asia as lecturers. This program which shall be conducted once a month, truly gives hope and 
confidence to aspiring Heavenly Tribal Messiah coordinators to be more committed in serving True 
Parents Vision to victoriously fulfill Heavenly Tribal Messiah mission and the settlement of new 
members in each Heavenly Tribal Messiah area. 
 
Now, the graduates of these two batches of 21-Day Hyojeong Leadership Training Program are assigned 
in different Heavenly Tribal Messiah areas centering in Metro Manila and nearby provinces and are 
supporting very well the Heavenly Tribal Messiah activities towards the victorious realization of Vision 
2020. 
 
As the year 2020 is fast approaching, the roars of victory in Heavenly Tribal Messiah mission are also 
vastly amplified in order to pave the way for victorious realization of substantial Cheon Il Guk! 
 

 


