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In the uplifting aftermath of their 80th Holy Birth and the victory of the Cheon Won Gung Cheon Il 
Sanctum, True Parents have launched a new providence. True Mother called for comprehensive 
mobilization towards national restoration through active witnessing. To mark the 63rd anniversary of 
Morimjeol on May 23rd, True Mother bestowed the Heavenly Fortune upon the members of the Family 
Federation. 
 
Subsequently, True Mother embarked on a significant journey to Yeosu, the hub of the ocean providence. 
From May 28th to 29th, over two inspiring days, she presided over the Determination and Dispatch 
Ceremony for the Restoration of the Nation at the beautiful Yeosu the Ocean Resort. 
 
This ceremony, exclusively convened for the devoted public officials of Sub-regions 3 and 4. 
 

 
 
Prominent officials from various organizations honored the occasion with their presence. These included 
Moon Yeon-ah and Jeong Won-ju, Chiefs of Staff from Dr. Hak Ja Han Moon's Secretariat; Song Yong-
cheon, President of FFWPU-International; Yang Chang-shik, Chairman of UPF International and UPF-
Korea; Song Gwang-seok, President of FFWPU-Korea; and Lee Gi-seong, Director of Cheonshimwon. 
Cheon Il Guk leaders, public officials of Sub-regions 3 and 4, as well as YSP Youth Church Leaders, 
were also in attendance. 
 

 
 
The first day offered a dynamic agenda filled with special offerings, an opening declaration, a banquet, 
and a captivating cultural performance. In her engaging discourse, True Mother recounted the 
providential history and the missions of Jesus and True Parents. She emphasized the monumental role of 
the Unification Church Family Federation, stating, "Their task is to carry forth the dreams of the 



 

 

Heavenly Parent and Jesus, bravely and fearlessly, embracing fallen humanity in all its complexities." 
 
The second day of the event built upon the previous day's inspirational momentum, with attendees 
viewing a Morimjeol video, indulging in praises led by YSP Youth Church Leaders, enjoying a Hyojeong 
Cultural Performance, and making a resolution chant. All of these activities culminated in a powerful 
closing ceremony, led by Song Gwang-seok, the President of the Family Federation. 
 

 
 
True Mother expanded upon the path of the Creator, the Heavenly Parent, highlighting the need for 
liberation and the consequential role of True Parents in this process. She stressed the significance of 
restoring the homeland of Heavenly Parent -- an aspiration humanity has been longing for over the past 
6,000 years. 
 
"Resolution towards a Heavenly Unified Korea must occur during my time on earth as the only-begotten 
Daughter, the True Mother," she asserted, further encouraging, "Now, we are one. We must evolve into 
filial children and loyal subjects who can proudly boast about the Heavenly Parent and True Parents." 
 
Echoing True Mother's sentiments, President Song Gwang-seok urged the congregation to emulate the 
resolute commitment of independence activists like Ahn Jung-geun and Yun Bong-gil. He rallied 
everyone towards the shared goal of a Heavenly Unified Nation, the homeland of the Heavenly Parent. 
 
Participants, inspired and moved, resolved to become victorious testimonials of substantial witnessing -- a 
critical stepping stone for the dream of national restoration shared by the Heavenly Parent and True 
Parents of Heaven, Earth, and Humankind. The event concluded on a high note with three cheers of Eog-
mansei, capturing the collective determination of all present. 
 
 
 


