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Diary Thursday 16 April 2020: A little self-reflection: 

 
It is said there are leader types and follower types among humans. When I think about which of these two 
categories would apply to myself I feel I belong to the follower types. This is because, when I look at my 
life, my past, I find I was rarely self-motivated and had little ambition. 
 
I always looked to others for inspiration and stimulation - even in my marriage. In the 32 years I have 
been living with my wife I have mostly relied on her as a guide and motivator. I almost never took charge 
of our family, mainly because I never really felt I knew what was right for our lives together and for our 
children. 
 
I have tended to be confused and easily sidetracked, never sure of myself. So in many ways I have always 
depended on others for guidance, inspiration and motivation. But there was always a problem: I was never 
a good follower, simply because I needed solitude very much. It's a dilemma since, not being self-
motivated I could not really live all by myself. Yet I was unable to fully adapt to being part of a group 
either. I always hated crowds, and in any kind of group I was always at least a silent rebel. I needed 
leadership but I could never follow a leader for long. 
 
In our marriage my wife and I have worked out a modus vivendi in which I defer to her for most 



 

 

decisions about our family but she gives me enough space and time for my own pursuits. This agreement 
took many struggles over many years to come to fruition, and it's still not quite stable. 
 
We were total strangers who couldn't even really talk to each other when we were matched by Rev. Sun 
Myung Moon in Seoul in October 1982. He blessed us in a 6,000-couple mass wedding just 4 days later. 
After this we didn't see each other for close to 4 years as she worked in Japan and I in Cyprus. During this 
time we wrote to each other but we always depended on others to translate our letters. I tried to call her on 
the phone once 3 years after our church wedding, but we could not talk at all because it was just too 
difficult. 
 
In 1986 we spent one week together in my parents' house in Luxembourg - in separate rooms. Then in 
1987 I went to Japan for one month and traveled with her to different places, always staying in separate 
rooms. We also visited her family. We got legally married in her hometown in southern Miyazaki 
Prefecture on Kyushu Island and also held a Shinto wedding ceremony in a nearby temple. 
 
I met her two older brothers and their families, and other relatives. Her parents were long gone. Her father 
had left the family and broke off contact when she was just 5 and her mother died a year before we first 
met in Seoul. 
 
She and I finally started our family in Tokyo in April 1988, 5½ years after our church wedding. We later 
lived together in Greece, where our first son was born, then in Egypt and Cyprus before settling down in 
Luxembourg in October 1991. 
 
Rev. Moon was the one who brought us together and launched us on this path to create a family. We were 
both followers of his movement - then known as the Unification Church. I had joined in the USA in 
March 1975 and my wife in Japan in October 1979, which just happened to be the time of my first visit to 
her country - not knowing her, of course. 
 
I still do feel grateful to the since-deceased Rev. Moon and the movement he began for having made our 
family possible. My wife continues to be a loyal follower of his movement, now led by his widow Hak Ja 
Han. 
 
I was always racked with doubt about him, about God and about the Divine Principle, the teaching that 
had inspired me to join his church. By the late 1990s I had mentally separated from Rev. Moon and even 
the whole concept of a God postulated by the monotheistic religions. 
 
My wife and I went through some struggles over this until we agreed that for our children's sake I would 
continue to go through the motions as if I was still a believer and would refrain from criticizing Rev. 
Moon, the church, its leaders and their idea of God. 
 
I have since drifted further and further away from the 'meme' of the God of religions. Inspired by many 
ideas in books I have read and discussions on the Internet I followed I have put together an alternative 
view of a God that satisfies my desire to have an understanding of what ultimate reality might be. 
 
I needed such an alternative idea because I wanted to escape, in a way, to get away from the strong pull of 
the 'meme' of God that kept me in thrall for so long. As I am not a leader type I cannot inspire anyone else 
with my idea, least of all my wife …. 
 
 
 


