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ear brothers and sisters, we are happy to 
report on the last Leadership Training Seminar 
we did from 3rd – 5th of April in our Training 
Center in Tirana – Albania centering on Rev. 

Shin, True Parents Special Envoy to Albania and 
Kosovo.  

Around 30 brothers & sisters attended the seminar 
including HQ staff, Community Leaders and their 
assistants, department leaders and providential 
organizations leaders. 

The purpose of this seminar was to convey to 
Albanian leadership and key members some part of 
the education material give at the ‘Education 
Program for the Enhancement of National Leaders’ 
which was held in Korea in February and also discuss 
and have brainstorming about New Witnessing Ways 
and how we can develop the providence in Albania 
in order to fulfill the Vision 2020.  

Some of the presentations included: True Parents 
Value, Spirituality, True Love Leadership. Rev. Shin 
gave very deep guidance to everyone and tried to 
convey in a very natural way Heavenly Parent and 
True Parents heart. 

Also he gave practical guidance based on his long 
experience in developing the foundation. The 
seminar also included moving testimonies from 
brothers and sisters on how Divine Principle and TP 
had changed their lives.  

One day was dedicated to discussion and 
brainstorming. Everybody was very much involved in 
giving ideas and proposals on how to go to a higher 
level and strengthen True Parents foundation in 
Albania and Kosovo.  

On the last session Rev. Shin presented to all, the 
CIG citizenship card. At the end of the seminar, 
everybody felt empowered and gained new 
determination to bring victory in their respective 
areas of responsibility.   

We thank our True Parents of Heaven Earth and 
Humankind for trusting and blessing us so much and 
we pledge to offer ourselves completely in order to 
live according to Vision 2020 motto given by our 
True Mother. Sincerely yours,  

Gani Rroshi – Albanian NL  
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