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Toward a World Culture of Peace 

Seoul, Korea - May 2- 6, 2023 
  

Plenary Reports Continued 

   

Peace Summit 2023: Session II-B: Elders Roundtable 

  

  

A new UPF initiative seeks to apply the 
wisdom and experience of society’s 
elders. 

 

 

 

   

Session III-B: Latin America and the Caribbean Region 

  

  

Session III-B of Peace Summit 2023, 
held May 3, 2023, focused on Latin 
America and the Caribbean Region. 

 

 

 

   

Session VI-B: Focus on Academicians, Part 1 

  

  

IAAP is an association of scholars 
working together to develop important 
content to fortify the core ideals, 
values and principles of a peace 
ideology.  

 

 

 

   

Session VII-B: Focus on Academicians, Part II 
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Contemporary Challenges to Global 
Order: Toward a World Culture of 
Peace: IAAP, Session 7B, was held 
May 4, 2023 as part of Peace Summit 
2023. 

 

 

 

   

Session VII-A: Focus on Media and Business Leaders  

  

  

UPF’s peace associations for the 
realms of the media and the business 
world held a joint plenary session 
during Peace Summit 2023 on May 4, 
2023. 

 

 

 

   

Session VII-C: Focus on Parliamentarians 

  

  

Legislators and parliamentarians 
representing their countries all over the 
world are given the ability to address 
their countries’ problems. 

 

 

 

   

 

 

Upcoming Events 
 

  

 

   

MAY 25: EUME: Middle East Peace Initiative Webinar 

MAY 27: UPF-UK: Africa Day 2023 

JUN 1: UN Global Day of Parents 

JUN 9: EUME-IAAP: World Peace Facing the Curse of Endless 

Approximation 

JUN 13: EUME: No Peace Without Women 

JUN 21: Academic Council of the UN (ACUNS) - Annual Meeting 
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