
 

 

America's Providential Role and Our Responsibility! 
 
Richard A. Panzer 
September 29, 2020 
World Peace and Unification Sanctuary – USA 
 

 
 
Transgression speaks to the wicked deep in his heart; there is no fear of God before his eyes. For he 

flatters himself in his own eyes that his iniquity cannot be found out and hated. The words of his mouth 

are trouble and deceit; he has ceased to act wisely and do good. He plots trouble while on his bed; he 

sets himself in a way that is not good; he does not reject evil. 
 
Your steadfast love, O Lord, extends to the heavens, your faithfulness to the clouds. Your righteousness is 

like the mountains of God; your judgments are like the great deep; man and beast you save, O Lord. How 

precious is your steadfast love, O God! The children of mankind take refuge in the shadow of your wings. 

They feast on the abundance of your house, and you give them drink from the river of your delights. For 

with you is the fountain of life; in your light do we see light. Oh, continue your steadfast love to those who 

know you, and your righteousness to the upright of heart! Let not the foot of arrogance come upon me, 

nor the hand of the wicked drive me away. There the evildoers lie fallen; they are thrust down, unable to 

rise. Psalm 36 
 
Even if people attend church for one hundred years, if they still have a self-centered mind they will never 

get to heaven. They cannot receive salvation. We need to know what kind of religion is a true religion, 

what kind of person is a true person, and what kind of nation is a true nation. SMM, CSG 645 
 
Dear 
 
Hyung Jin Nim started the service by discussing how Facebook CEO Mark Zuckerburg thinks it's okay to 
shut people's speech down if it disagrees with the beliefs of the elites. Leftists think it's okay to control 
others. 
 
Marx created a demonic ideology that led to 220 million deaths. Now we have academics who are 
infatuated with his teachings. Lenin wrote about taking down the middle class, using media and 
psychological tactics. 
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It's irresponsible to send children to public schools to be indoctrinated and even given condoms without 
their parents knowing. That obviously damages trust with their parents, which, believe it or not, is the 
intent. Socialists since Plato have written about the need to weaken the nuclear family. The popular 
culture wages a constant cultural attack on strong alpha males while giving endless praise for women as 
infallible "goddesses" who cannot be criticized. 
 

 
Ted O'Grady w Sudos at DC Prayer Rally 
 
The current national, centralized police system is dangerous, especially when directed by leftist 
governments. King Saul was trying to kill David using a state army. Our nation's original system was the 
Sheriff system, where citizens could elect and, if needed, remove those who abuse power. America's 
Founding Fathers did not resist the British government for the purpose of creating another centralized 
tyranny. 
 
In NYC there used to be 10,000 religious charitable organizations. Now, faceless government 
bureaucracies are doing much of that, but the majority of our welfare system's funding goes to the salaries 
of the bureaucrats, not for actually helping people. 
 
James 4:7 says resist the devil and he will flee. Benjamin Franklin suggested placing on the USA national 
seal the statement, "Resistance to tyrants is obedience to God." Atheists question the morality of a God 
who orders the Israelites to utterly destroy the Canaanite tribes, but it was in order to stop the killing and 
raping of children which were the practices of Baal worship and Temple prostitution. 
 

 
Pierangelo and Pennsylvanian at DC Prayer Rally 
 
The Our Father Forsaken book describes the archeological record of an ancient Egyptian man who sold 
his own daughter into temple prostitution. The most prized slaves in the Arabian slave trade were young 
white girls. The Bible says the beginning of wisdom is the fear of God. 
 
The Democratic party is the one trying to undermine natural marriage and the nuclear family. The popular 
culture often celebrates evil. 
 
It took so much effort on God's part to liberate people from such evil. Believers must not be like the 
ostrich, shutting their eyes to evil. Women need to look for marriage-quality men. America has a 
generation of women who do not know how to deal with men and end up destroying their own children. 
 
Every week the Sanctuary Prolife team including Ted, Yumi-san and others saves a child. It's wrong to 



 

 

take the life of a child who has God's image. 
 
The believers' strength was that they feared God. The Israelites were told to wipe out the Canaanite 
culture, but not to take loot, rape or plunder. When we fight for liberty, it must not be for our own self-
benefit. 
 

********** 
 
CHECK OUT our 5 EXCITING 

Fall HSU classes! 

 

Classes begin the week of October 18. 

 

Class #1: "Exploring the Eight Great Textbooks" 

Leader: Reverend Rabbi Lewis Leibel Pearlman 

 

Class #2: "Today's Balaam and Balak: How Kinsey popularized fornication in America" 

Leader: Lowell Ellanson 

 

Class #3: "Absolute Good Sex" 

Leaders: Rob and Gaia Carvell 

 

Class #4: "The Words of True Mother Hyun Shil Kang" 

Leader: Rosemary Yokoi 

 

Class #5: "Distinguishing Christ and His New Truth" 

Leader: SunMee Montanaro 

 

Class #6: "True Parents" (Spanish) 

Leader: David Kanagy 

 

Sign up at 

ChristKingdomGospel.org 

 

*********** 
 
May God bless you and your families! 
 
Sincerely, 
 
Richard 
 
Richard A. Panzer, Ph.D., President 
World Peace and Unification Sanctuary – USA 
 
 


